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 Terms and Conditions for Calvary Chapel Ramona’s Trip 

Monday, August 12, 2024 – Friday, August 16, 2024 

Exhibit A 
 

 

Tour cost:  $1,455.00 per adult ages 18-59 double occupancy, $1,433.00 per senior ages 60+ double 

occupancy, and $1,357.00 per youth ages 11-17.  Single supplement cost is $350.00 per person additional. 

 

Deposits:  Total deposits in the amount of $3,460.00 for airline ($2,550.00), the museums ($300.00), and the 

bus ($610.00) is due by March 18, 2024.  Of that total amount, the airline deposit of $2,550.00 is 

nonrefundable, $300.00 for the museums deposit is refundable, and $585.00 of the bus deposit is refundable.  A 

nonrefundable deposit of $100.00 per person is due by April 5, 2024 and final payment for each participant is 

due by June 21, 2024.   

 

Tour Price Includes:  Roundtrip air from San Diego to Kentucky and motor coach transportation as indicated 
on the itinerary (Exhibit B), admissions to the Creation Museum on August 13 and the Ark Encounter on 
August 14 & 15, four (4) nights’ accommodations at Springfield Suite by Marriott Cincinnati Airport South in 
Florence, KY.  Pastor Rob Hubbard and an additional guest shall travel with the group at no cost.  All taxes and 
bus driver gratuities, nine (9) meals consisting of four (4) breakfasts, three (3) lunches and two (2) dinners.  
 

Trip Cancellation Insurance: Optional travel insurance is available at an additional cost.  Travel insurance 
typically covers the passenger for emergency medical expenses while on a trip and cancellations due to 
sickness, injury, or death of the passenger or a family member.  Individual pricing is available by contacting 
Holt Travel & Tours. 
 
Payment options: Payment for the total initial deposit of $3,460.00 can be paid by check or credit card (to be 
charged separately to the three suppliers) with a Visa, Mastercard, American Express or Discover Card.  All 
payments deposited into California Trust Bank in Alpine are insured up to $100,000 by the FDIC.  Checks are 
to be made payable to Holt Travel & Tours and can be dropped off at the Holt Travel & Tours office at 2241 W. 
Victoria Drive, Alpine, CA  91901 at a mutually agreed time and date with David Holt.  
 
Returned check fee: 
There will be a $20.00 fee for checks return unpaid.   
 
Cancellations and Refunds:  Cancellations must be made in writing to Holt Travel.  After final payment is 
made by June 21 2024, the trip is totally nonrefundable.  The nonrefundable deposit is not transferrable to 
another participant under any circumstance.  If travel insurance has been purchased, refunds can be requested 
directly through Travel Insured for the covered reasons as listed on the individual’s insurance policy.  Unused 
portion of the tour are nonrefundable. 

     
Liability: Holt Travel & Tours’ responsibility is strictly limited as an agent for the trip participants in all 
matters connected with buses, museums, restaurants, and flights, and as an agency holds itself free of 
responsibility for any liability occurring due to the performance of the independent contractors supplying 
services for this trip.  Neither Holt Travel nor its agents or employees shall be liable for any accident, injury, 
property damage or personal loss, expense, or inconvenience in connection with any transportation or travel 
services that result directly or indirectly from any occurrence or conditions beyond their control including, but 
not limited to, defects in vehicles, breakdown in equipment, theft, delay or cancellation, late departures, change 
of schedule, strikes, acts of god, commercial frustration, acts of war or terrorism, or the willful or negligent act 
and/or omission by the provider of services or their respective representatives without limitation, their failure to 
deliver, or inadequate delivery of travel services.  Holt Travel & Tours will do everything in its power to insure 
that all the arrangements for this tour are delivered to trip participants.  By submitting your payment for this 
trip, you are accepting these terms and conditions in their entirety.  
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Alternative Dispute Resolution-Arbitration: 

Any controversy or claims arising out of or relating to the contract or breach thereof shall be settled by binding 

arbitration in accordance with the rules of the American Arbitration Association and judgment upon award 

rendered by the arbitrator(s) may be entered in a court in the jurisdiction of Holt Travel & Tours physical 

location of business.  Costs and attorney fees shall be awarded to the prevailing party. 
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